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This booklet uses easy 
words and pictures. 

You might need 
someone to help you 
understand it.

You have met with the 
surgeon and agreed you 
need an operation.

You are now on a 
waiting list.

easy read
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It is important you 
attend this appointment.

Please let us know if you 
need support to attend.

Before your operation 
you will be given an 
appointment in pre-
assessment clinic.

Here you will have 
some medical tests to 
make sure you are well 
enough for surgery.
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You will speak the Heart 
Specialist Nurse.

They will complete your 
assessment.

We have other easy 
reads explaining these 
tests.

They will ask about your 
medications.
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And when you are due 
to next bleed/ have a 
period.

And your general 
health.

If you have female 
reproductive organs 
they will check if you 
could be pregnant.

If you could be pregnant 
they will check if you are.
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This is to get rid of any 
bugs living on your skin 
that you do not know 
about.

You will be given a hair 
and body wash to use at 
home, for 5 days, before 
you come in for your 
operation.

You will need to have 
had a recent dental 
check - they will check 
when this was.
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Your Cardiac Nurse will 
help you make a plan.

This website has lots of 
good information on it 
to help you:

www.leedsth.nhs.uk/
shape-up-for-surgery

We want you to be 
as well as you can be 
before surgery.

We will ask you about 
smoking, drinking 
alcohol and exercise.
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You might prefer  a 
quiet area to wait.

You might need 
someone to stay with 
you for support.

This plan will include 
what reasonable 
adjustments you might 
need to stay in hospital.
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You can ask the heart 
specialist nurse any 
questions and about 
what happens next.

You may want to visit 
the ward area before 
admission and meet 
some of the staff.

You may prefer a side 
room.

If a relative is staying 
with you.

We will always try our 
best to support this.
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If you have a Learning 
Disability or Autism 
diagnosis please think 
about completing a 
Health Passport 

Please email this to the 
Learning Disability and 
Autism Team at Leeds 
Teaching Hospitals on 
Leedsth-tr.LDAutism@
nhs.net

This will then be added 
to your medical records 
so staff understand you 
better.
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